BOARD OF EDUCATION
CITY OF LONG BRANCH
NEW JERSEY

MINUTES AUGUST 30, 2022

The Agenda Meeting of the Long Branch Board of Education was held in the Long Branch
Administrative Office, 540 Broadway, Long Branch, New Jersey.

Mrs. Youngblood Brown called the meeting to order at 6:05 P.M.

A.

ROLL CALL

Mrs. Youngblood Brown - President  Dr. Critelli Mrs. Peters

Mrs. Perez - Vice President - ZOOM  Mr. Zambrano  Ms. Benosky - absent
Mr. Grant Mr. Covin Mr. Ferraina

Attorney — Staci Sabetti, Esq. - ZOOM

A-1.

C-1.

STATEMENT OF THE MANNER OF NOTIFICATION OF THE MEETING

Peter E. Genovese Ill, RSBO, QPA, School Business Administrator/Board Secretary stated
adequate notice of the meeting of the Long Branch Board of Education has been provided by a
Schedule of Public Meetings published in the Asbury Park Press. Mr. Genovese further stated
a Schedule of Public Meetings has been posted in the Board of Education Office and the Office
of the City Clerk, Long Branch, New Jersey.

Mr. Genovese made the following announcement: Fire exits are located in the direction
indicated. In case of fire, you will be signaled by bell and/or public address system. If so alerted
to fire, please move in a calm and orderly fashion to the nearest smoke-free exit.

. OBJECTIONS, IF ANY, TO THE VALIDITY OF THE MEETING

Mr. Genovese stated that the objecting member must give supporting reasons.

FLAG SALUTE AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
Mrs. Youngblood Brown, Board President, salute the flag and led the Pledge of Allegiance.

STATEMENT TO THE PUBLIC

Mrs. Youngblood Brown made the following announcement: Often times it may appear to
members of our audience that the Board of Education takes action with very little comment and
in many cases by unanimous vote. Before a matter is placed on the agenda at a public meeting,
the administration has thoroughly reviewed the matter with the Superintendent of Schools. If the
Superintendent of Schools is satisfied that the matter is ready to be presented to the Board of
Education, it is then referred to the appropriate Board committee. The members of the Board
committee work with the administration and Superintendent to assure that the members fully
understand the matter. When the committee is satisfied with the matter, it is presented to the
Board of Education for discussion before any final action is taken. Only then is it placed on the
agenda for action at a public meeting. All agenda attachments are available for public review. In
rare instances, matters are presented to the Board of Education for discussion at the same
meeting that final action may be taken.
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C-1. STATEMENT TO THE PUBLIC (continued)

Time may be allocated for public comment at this meeting. Each speaker may be allotted up to
three (3) minutes and one (1) opportunity to address the Board when recognized by the presiding
officer. Individuals wishing to address the Board shall be recognized by the presiding officer and
shall give their names, addresses and the group, if any, that they represent. Although the Board
encourages public participation, it reserves the right, through its presiding officer, to terminate
remarks to and/or by any individual not in keeping with the conduct of a proper and efficient
meeting. With the exception of those individuals whose names are on the agenda this evening,
the Board will not respond to questions during the public participation portion of this meeting
involving the employment, appointment, termination of employment, negotiations, terms and
conditions of employment, evaluation of the performance of, promotion or disciplining of any
specific, prospective or current employee.

C-2. OPPORTUNITY TO ADDRESS THE BOARD RELATING TO AGENDA ITEMS
No one addressed the Board.

C-3. Comments from the Finance Committee Chair (APPENDIX C-1) - Mrs. Youngblood Brown

Mr. Ferraina asked that there be a plan in place for the radios so that we are not waiting until they all
break to replace them.

Mr. Rodriguez stated that we currently have an annual plan in place that we use for trucks, buses and
chromebooks.

Mrs. Youngblood Brown reviewed with the Board the various services the Finance Committee had
discussed and what their recommendation would be to go out for a Request for Proposal for next year.
The full Board also had the opportunity to review the list.

Mr. Ferraina suggested that all services should go out for a Request for Proposal.

Mrs. Youngblood Brown asked Mr. Genovese if this would be included in the agenda for tomorrow
night.

Mr. Genovese stated that it will be for those services that the Finance Committee thought were
appropriate to seek proposals for.

D. APPROVAL OF MINUTES
| entertain a motion that the Board approve the following minutes:

e Annual Retreat Meeting minutes of July 20, 2022
e Regular Meeting minutes of July 27, 2022
e Executive Session Meeting minutes of July 27, 2022
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E. SECRETARY’S REPORT

1. BUDGET TRANSFER REPORTS — FY2022 APRIL AND FY2022 MAY
| entertain a motion that the Board approve the following Budget Transfer Resolution (which will
be labeled APPENDIX E-1 and made part of the permanent minutes upon Board approval).

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-16.10 "Budgetary Controls and Over expenditure of
Funds" states a "district Board of Education or Charter School Board of Trustees shall
implement controls over budgeted revenues and appropriations and shall not approve any
obligation or payment in excess of the amount appropriated by the district Board of Education
in the line item pursuant to N.J.S.A. 18A:22-8.1.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the attached line item transfers FY 2022

April and FY2022 May as listed be approved for the months ending April 30, 2022 and May 31,
2022.

Peter E. Genovese lll, RSBO, QPA
School Business Administrator / Board Secretary
Ayes:
Nays:
Absent:
Date: August 31, 2022

2. BOARD SECRETARY’S REPORT - APRIL, 2022 AND MAY, 2022
| recommend the Board approve the Board Secretary’s Report for the months ending April 30,

2022 and May 31, 2022 (which will be labeled APPENDIX E-2 and made part of the permanent
minutes upon Board approval).

3. REPORT OF THE TREASURER - APRIL, 2022 AND MAY, 2022
| recommend the Board approve the Report of the Treasurer for the months ending April 30,

2022 and May 31, 2022 (which will be labeled APPENDIX E-3 and made part of the permanent
minutes upon Board approval).

4. MONTHLY CERTIFICATION OF SCHOOL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATOR/BOARD
SECRETARY
Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-16.10(c)(3), | certify that as of the April 30, 2022 and May 31, 2022
Board Secretary’s Report, no line item account has encumbrances and expenditures which in
total exceed the line item appropriation in violation of N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-16.10(a).

Peter E. Genovese Ill, RSBO, QPA
School Business Administrator/Board Secretary
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E.
5.

SECRETARY’S REPORT (continued)

MONTHLY CERTIFICATION OF BOARD OF EDUCATION
| recommend the Board approve the following Resolution:

RESOLUTION

BE IT RESOLVED, that pursuant to N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-16.10(c)(4), we, the Members
of the Board of Education, after a review of the Board Secretary’s and Treasurer's Monthly
Financial Reports and upon consultation with the appropriate district officials, certify that to the
best of our knowledge that as of April 30, 2022 and May 31, 2022 no major account or fund has
been over-expended in violation of N.J.A.C. 6A:23A-16.10 (b) and that sufficient funds are
available to meet the district’s financial obligations for the remainder of the fiscal year.

Peter E. Genovese |ll, RSBO, QPA
School Business Administrator / Board Secretary

Ayes:

Nays:

Absent:

Date: August 31, 2022

BILLS AND CLAIMS - JULY 15 - 31, 2022 AND AUGUST 1 - 31, 2022 FOR CHRIST THE
KING AND THE CITY OF LONG BRANCH

| entertain a motion that the Board approve the bills and claims for July 15 - 31, 2022 and August
1-31, 2022 for Christ the King and the City of Long Branch (which will be labeled APPENDIX
E-4 and made part of the permanent minutes upon Board approval).

BILLS AND CLAIMS - JULY 15 - 31, 2022 AND AUGUST 1 - 31, 2022 EXCLUDING CHRIST
THE KING AND THE CITY OF LONG BRANCH

| entertain a motion that the Board approve the bills and claims for July 15 - 30, 2022 and August
1 - 31, 2022 excluding Christ the King and the City of Long Branch (which will be labeled
APPENDIX E-4 and made part of the permanent minutes upon Board approval).

RECONCILIATION MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT — SODEXO — JULY 31, 2022

| entertain a motion that the Board approve the monthly operating reports for the Sodexo
Corporation, Food Service Management Company for the Long Branch School District for July
31, 2022 (which will be labeled APPENDIX E-5 and made part of the permanent minutes upon
Board approval).

ATHLETIC FUND & ELEMENTARY SCHOOLS, MIDDLE SCHOOL & HIGH SCHOOL
STUDENT FUNDS AS OF JULY 31, 2022

| entertain a motion that the Board approve the monthly reports for the Athletic Fund, the
Elementary Schools, Middle School, and High School Student Funds as of July 31, 2022 (which
will be labeled APPENDIX E-6 and made part of the permanent minutes upon Board approval).
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F. SUPERINTENDENT’S REPORT

START AND END TIME OF SCHOOLS - APPENDIX F-1

IMPORTANT DATES - 2022 - 2023 - APPENDIX F-2

A. Open House/Back To School Nights
B. Marking Period Schedule for All District Schools
C. Parent/Teacher Conferences

RECOGNITION OF ACHIEVEMENT

A. Orange Pencil Award

The Maplewoodshop Woodworking Summer Program has been awarded the

Orange Pencil Award - Jeremy Martin

B. Sustainable Jersey for Schools - Silver Certification

This year each of the Long Branch Public Schools have achieved the highest
certification level with Sustainable Jersey for Schools. This certification is awarded to
schools who attain at least 350 submission points with Sustainable Jersey for Schools.
It signifies that the district has made significant progress in a number of categories
toward sustainability and is a statewide and national leader. The district and each school
will be recognized for their efforts during the New Jersey School Board Association

Workshop in October of 2022.

Minutes — Agenda Meeting

August 30, 2022



G. GENERAL ITEMS

1. APPROVAL OF COOPERATIVE PURCHASES
| recommend the Board approve the list of cooperative purchases that exceed the bid threshold
as listed on APPENDIX G-1.

2. RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PROCUREMENT OF GOODS AND SERVICES
THROUGH STATE AGENCY FOR THE 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve the following resolution:

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, Title 18A:18A-10 provides that, “A Board of Education, without
advertising for bids, or after having rejected all bids obtained pursuant to advertising
therefore, by resolution may purchase any goods or services pursuant to a contract or
contracts for such goods or services entered into on behalf of the State by the Division of
Purchase and Property, and

WHEREAS, the Long Branch Board of Education has the need, on a timely basis, to
procure goods and services utilizing state contracts, and

WHEREAS, the Long Branch Board of Education desires to authorize its purchasing
agent for the 2022 - 2023 school year to make any and all purchases necessary to meet
the needs of the school district throughout the school year,

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Long Branch Board of Education
does hereby authorize the district's purchasing agent to make purchases of goods and
services entered into on behalf of the State by the Division of Purchase and Property
utilizing various vendors as listed:

Commodity/Service Vendor State Contract #
13121 - Software Reseller Services Dell Marketing L.P. 20-TELE-01510
T1316 - Telecommunications Converge One Inc. 80802

Equipment & Services

Peter E. Genovese lll, RSBO, QPA
School Business Administrator / Board Secretary

Ayes:

Nays:

Absent:

Date: August 30, 2020

3. APPROVAL OF HALF DAY SCHEDULE - MIDDLE SCHOOL AND HIGH SCHOOL TESTING
| recommend the Board approve a half day schedule for Middle School students who will be

state testing on May 2, 3, 4 and 5, 2023 and High School students who will be state testing on
May 2, 3 and 4, 2023.
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G. GENERAL ITEMS (continued)

4. ACCEPTANCE OF SURPLUS EQUIPMENT BID

| recommend the Board accept the following bids for surplus equipment received on August 23,
2022 as listed:

ITEM Atlantic Elite Equipment Simon Liberty
Paving, Services, Inc. Kassas | Motors Inc.
LLC

2007 Chevy/Mid/24 passenger $100.00 $255.00 No Bid $914.99
bus - 721
2007 Chevy/Mid/24 passenger | $100.00 $255.00 No Bid $913.99
bus - 722
2007 Chevy/Mid/24 passenger | $100.00 $255.00 No Bid $818.99
bus - 723
2003 S185 Bobcat Loader No Bid $1,026.00 No Bid $418.99
2006 Ford F-350 Rack Truck $100.00 $1,026.00 No Bid $718.99
2000 Ford 550 - Food Service $100.00 $1,026.00 No Bid $718.99
Laptop Carts - 179 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grab and Go Refrigerator $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Blodgett/Zephaire oven (top $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
and bottom) - 2
Berkel Meat Slicer - 2 $120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Flavorview Warmer $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Green Cambro Salad Bar - 2 $200.00 No Bid $200.00 No Bid
Flavorview Warmer - 2 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Globe Slicer $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
True Grab and Go No Bid No Bd No Bid No Bid
Refrigerators - 4

5, APPROVAL OF PAID SCHOOL LUNCH PRICES
| recommend the Board approve the school lunch prices for paid students for the 2022 - 2023
school year. The prices will remain the same as last school year, $2.00 for Pre-K through
elementary students and $2.25 for Middle School and High School students.
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G. GENERAL ITEMS (continued)

6. APPROVAL TO ACCEPT NONPUBLIC SCHOOL STATE AID ALLOCATIONS FOR
SERVICES UNDER CHAPTER 192/193 FOR THE 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR
I recommend the Board accept the Nonpublic School State Aid Allocations for services under
Chapter 192/193 for the 2022 - 2023 school year as listed below:

Chapter 192

Program:
Compensatory Education: $1,977.00
ESL: 0.00

Total: $1,977.00

Chapter 193

Program:

Initial Exam & Class $1,326.00
Annual Exam & Class $ 760..00
Supplemental Inst. $2478.00

Total: $ 4,564.00

| recommend the Board authorize Alisa Aquino, Director of Grants & Innovative Programs,
or her designee, to serve as the district's contact person for the above actions.

| further recommend Francisco E. Rodriguez, Superintendent of Schools, be designated the
Board's representative to implement the above actions.

7. APPROVAL OF FALL, WINTER AND SPRING SPORTS SCHEDULES - 2022 - 2023
SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve the Middle School and High School fall athletic schedules for
the fall, winter and spring of the 2022 - 2023 school year as listed on APPENDIX G-2.

8. ACCEPTANCE OF DISTRICT WIDE TRUNKED RADIO NETWORK BID
| recommend the Board accept the bid of Wireless Electronics Inc, for District Wide Trunked
Radio Network in the amount of $1,549,000.

9. APPROVAL OF ADDENDUM TO ACCESS AGREEMENT
| recommend the Board authorize the approval of an addendum to a site access agreement
for certain soil investigative work by Exxon Mobil at 417 Indiana Avenue, Long Branch, New
Jersey for an additional 2 years.

10. GIFTS TO SCHOOL
| recommend the Board accept the gifts to schools indicated - APPENDIX G-3.
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PERSONNEL ACTION

RESCIND EMPLOYMENT - CONTRACTUAL POSITION
| recommend the Board rescind the employment contract for the following individuals:

DARREN BOONE, Instructional Assistant, August 17, 2022.
KENNETH EAGEL, Teacher, effective August 22, 2022.

ANTHONY FIGUEROA, Teacher, effective August 5, 2022.

TYLER GRABLE, Instructional Assistant, effective August 1, 2022.
BRIANNA NUZZO, Instructional Assistant, effective August 10, 2022.

RETIREMENT

| recommend the Board accept with regret and best wishes the retirement of the following
individuals:

JENNIFER ELGRIM, Teacher, effective January 1, 2023. Mrs. Elgrim has a total of 34 years
and 3 months of service.

BETTIE SMITH, Instructional Assistant, effective January 1, 2023. Ms. Smith has a total
of 22 years and 3 months of service.

RESIGNATION - CONTRACTUAL POSITIONS
| recommend the Board accept the resignation of the following individuals:

MEGAN FUENTES, Elementary Teacher, effective August 24, 2022.

ANGELA GAYNOR, Bilingual Elementary Teacher, effective October 16, 2022, or sooner
if a suitable candidate is found.

ELIZABETH GIRON, Guidance Counselor, effective October 25, 2022, or sooner if a suitable
candidate is found.

KRISTIN GREELEY, Special Education Teacher, effective August 16, 2022

KELLI NAPOLITANO, Elementary Teacher, effective July 27, 2022.

JANET RENDA, Special Education Teacher, effective October 22, 2022, or sooner if a
suitable candidate is found.

BENJAMIN RIVERA, Middle School Teacher, effective August 1, 2022

JONATHAN TRZESZKOWSKI, Special Education Teacher, effective August 23, 2022

ANA WARNER, Elementary Teacher, effective October 26, 2022, or sooner if a suitable
candidate is found.

RESIGNATION - STIPEND POSITION
I recommend the Board accept the resignation of the following individuals:

CARI GREENWOOD, Gregory School ELA Head Teacher, effective August 5, 2022
ROSALIE GUZZI, Middle School Assistant Field Hockey Coach, effective August 18, 2022.

RESIGNATION - STIPEND POSITION
I recommend the Board accept the resignation of the following individual:

ELISA PEREZ, Middle School Head Coach Field Hockey Coach, effective August 15, 2022
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

6. STAFF TRANSFERS - 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve the transfer of the following individuals:

ALEXANDRA CASARES, from Lenna W. Conrow Early Childhood Learning Center Teacher to
Joseph M. Ferraina Early Childhood Learning Center Teacher.

CARRIE CHO, from Joseph M. Ferraina Early Childhood Learning Center / Morris Avenue
School Teacher to Gregory School Teacher.

JASMINE GOMEZ, from George L. Catrambone School Teacher to Middle School Teacher.
PAOLA MACHIN, from Gregory School Teacher to Amerigo A. Anastasia School Teacher.
JAMIL PITTS, from Amerigo A. Anastasia School Teacher to Gregory School Teacher.

7. ABOLISHMENT/CREATION OF POSITION - RESOLUTION
| recommend the Board approve the abolishment of a 10-month secretary position and the
creation of a 12-month secretary position - APPENDIX H-1.

8. CREATION OF NEW POSITIONS - RESOLUTION

| recommend the Board approved the creation of positions as indicated due to district needs -
APPENDIX H-2.

Mr. Rodriguez reviewed all staff appointments with the Board.

9. APPOINTMENT OF CERTIFIED STAFF
| recommend the Board approve/ratify the appointment of the following named individuals who
constitutes a careful selection and screening of applicants and is hereby recommended for an
employment contract contingent upon the successful completion of their degree program, New
Jersey Department of Education certification requirements, and all other state and federal
guidelines included but not limited to: a criminal history clearance and successful clearance of
S-141/A-3381 (P.L.2018, ¢.5) This initial appointment may change as district needs develop:

SAMANTHA BURRIER Italian Teacher
High School
MA+30, Step 9
$68,061.00

Certification: Teacher of Italian

Education: Rutgers University

Replaces: Alessandra Farruggio (Resignation)

(Acct. # 15-140-100-101-000-01-00) (UPC # 0139-01-WRDLG-TEACHR)

RACHAEL BOTTONE Elementary Teacher
Gregory School
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Elementary Gr. K-6

Education: Rowan University

Replaces: Kelli Napolitano (Resignation)

(Acct. # 15-120-100-101-000-07-00) (UPC # 0656-07-GRDE3-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

9. APPOINTMENT OF CERTIFIED STAFF (continued)

ALEXIS CORBETT Biology Teacher
High School
MA, Step 2
$60,761.00

Certification: Teacher of Biology

Education: University of Colorado Denver

Replaces: Samantha Covert-Pinca (Transfer)

(Acct. # 15-140-100-101-000-01-00) (UPC # 0106-01-SCNCE-TEACHR)

Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical, Fingerprints &

Certification*

KRISTINA DANNUNZIO Special Ed Teacher
Morris Avenue
MA, Step 1
$60,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Preschool - Gr. 3

Education: Fordham University

Replaces: Jessica Sargent (Reassignment)

(Acct. # 15-110-100-101-000-05-00) (UPC # 1237-05-PRESC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*

DANIELLE DEMARCO Preschool Teacher
Lenna W. Conrow
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Preschool - Gr. 3

Education: Georgian Court University

Replaces: Dawn O'Grady (Resignation)

(Acct. #20-218-100-101-000-08-00) (UPC # 0738-08-PRESC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical, Fingerprints &

Certification™

CELIA FRANCES Preschool Teacher
Morris Avenue
MA, Step 3
$61,511.00

Certification: Teacher of Preschool - Gr. 3

Education: New York University

Replaces: Anthony Migliaccio (Retirement)

(Acct. # 15-110-100-101-000-05-00) (UPC # 1275-05-PRESC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

9. APPOINTMENT OF CERTIFIED STAFF (continued)

SHAVANY GONZALEZ Preschool Teacher
Joseph M. Ferraina
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Preschool - Gr. 3

Education: Montclair State University

Replaces: Lirizell Bello (Resignation)

(Acct. # 20-218-100-101-000-04-00) (UPC # 0474-04-PRESC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*

AMANDA GRIFFIN Special Ed. Math Teacher
Middle School
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Students with Disabilities

Education: Western Governors University

Replaces: Joseph Fackenthal (Resignation)

(Acct. # 15-213-100-101-000-02-00) (UPC # 0289-02-SELDI-TEACHR)

Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*

KAYLA HILL Elementary Teacher
Gregory School
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Elementary

Education: The College of New Jersey

Replaces: Ashley Dzuiba (Resignation)

(Acct # 15-120-100-101-000-07-00) (UPC # 0654-07-GRDE2-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical, Fingerprints

AMI KASS Preschool Teacher
Morris Avenue
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Preschool - Gr. 3

Education: Tulane University

Replaces: Kerin Halper (Resignation)

(Acct. # 20-218-100-101-000-05-00) (UPC # 1276-05-PRESC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

9. APPOINTMENT OF CERTIFIED STAFF (continued)

MARY JO KINDZIERSKI School Nurse
Historic High School
BA, Step 10
$64,261.00

Certification: School Nurse

Education: Seton Hall University

Replaces: Margaret Chapman (Transfer)

(Acct. # 15-000-213-100-000-15-00) (UPC # 1488-15-OFPPS-NURSE)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*

TRACY KUKAN Special Ed Math Teacher
Audrey W. Clark
MA, Step 9
$66,561.00

Certification: Teacher of the Handicapped

Education: Lander University

Replaces: Open UPC .

(Acct. # 15-209-100-101-000-06-60) (UPC # 1561-06-SELDI-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*

MARCOS MARTINEZ World Language Teacher
Amerigo A. Anastasia
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Spanish

Education: Jersey City University

Replaces: Brenda Itzol (Reassighment)

(Acct. # 15-120-100-101-000-03-00) (UPC # 0941-03-WRDLG-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Certification*

JESSICA MATOS Mathematics Teacher
Middle School
MA, Step 1
$60,011.00

Certification: Elementary School Teacher with Mathematics Specialization Gr. 5-8
Education: Rider University

Replaces: Nicole Carroll (Reassignment)

(Acct. # 15-130-100-101-000-02-00) (UPC # 0245-02-MATHC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)
9. APPOINTMENT OF CERTIFIED STAFF (continued)

GIULIA MAZZONE Special Ed Math Teacher
Middle School
BA, Step 1
$56,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Students with Disabilities

Education: Monmouth University

Replaces: Luke Balina (Transfer)

(Acct. # 15-213-100-101-000-02-00) (UPC # 1463-02-LDMTH-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical, Fingerprints &

Certification™

ABIGAIL RIOS Bilingual Guidance Counselor
Middle School
MA, Step 3
$61, 511.00

Certification: Guidance Counselor

Education: Monmouth University

Replaces: Elizabeth Giron (Resignation)

(Acct. # 15-000-218-104-000-02-00) (UPC # 0230-02-GUIDN-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical, Fingerprints*

KASSANDRA RUBOYIANES Dance Teacher
George L. Catrambone
MA, Step 1
$60,011.00

Certification: Teacher of Dance

Education: Rutgers University

Replaces: Jasmine Gomez (Transfer)

(Acct. # 15-120-100-101-000-09-00) (UPC # 1349-09-MUSIC-TEACHR)
Effective: September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*

10. APPOINTMENT OF INSTRUCTIONAL ASSISTANTS
| recommend the Board approve the following named individuals as an Instructional Assistants:

BURAK ATES, George L. Catrambone School at Step 1 $20,384.00 + $250 Stipend for BA,
effective September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.
Replaces: Dudley Davis

(Acct. #15-190-100-106-000-09-00) (UPC #1344-09-KINDG-PARAPF)

SHAVON FORESMAN, Joseph M. Ferraina ECLC at Step 1 $20,384.00 + $250 Stipend for
BA, effective September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.
Replaces: Jamie Gates (Resigned)

(Acct. # 20-218-100-106-000-04-00) (UPC # 0503-04-PRESC-PARAPF)
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

10. APPOINTMENT OF INSTRUCTIONAL ASSISTANTS (continued)

JOSEPH MISCIA, George L. Catrambone School at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective September 1,
2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: Open UPC

(Acct. #15-204-100-106-000-09-00) (UPC #0811-09-SEAUT-PARAPF)

MARIANA MORENO, Lenna W. Conrow ECLC at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective September 1,
2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: Lauren Flynn (Reassignment)

(Acct. # 11-216-100-106-000-08-00) (UPC # 0748-08-SEPSD-PARAPF)

JOSEFA NAVARRO, Little Waves at Step 1 $20,384.00 +$250 Stipend of BA, effective
September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: Open UPC

(Acct. # 11-800-330-100-000-12-01) (UPC # 0916-12-LTWAV-PARAPF)

JUSTIN NEMEIL NAVARRO, Middle School at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective September 1, 2022
Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: Kevin Schaubert (Reassignment)

(Acct. #15-201-100-106-000-02-00) (UPC #0332-02-SEMCI-PARAPF)

RADEYA PRESSLEY, Lenna W. Conrow ECLC at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective
September 1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical, Fingerprints & ParaPro Test*.
Replaces: Rita Russamanno (Retirement)

(Acct. #20-218-100-106-000-08-00) (UPC # 0763-08-PRESC-PARAPF)

HYIESHA REEVEY, Little Waves at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective September 1, 2022
Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: New Creation

(Acct. #11-800-330-100-000-12-01) (UPC #1636-12-LTWAV-PARAPF)

YAMILEX RIVERA, Long Branch High School at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective September
1, 2022 Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: Kamilla Dosantos (Transfer)

(Acct. # 15-240-100-106-000-01-00) (UPC # 1484-01-ESLAN-PARAPF)

SCHANELLE SMITH, Audrey W. Ciark at Step 1 $20,384.00, effective September 1, 2022
Pending Pre Employment Physical & Fingerprints*.

Replaces: Lauren Bland (Resignation)

(Acct. # 15-209-100-106-000-06-00) (UPC # 0646-06-SELDI-PARAPF)

11. PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITIONS - SUMMER 2022

Summer Bus Aides $13.00/hr.
Shardaye Williams*

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022

15



12.

13.

14.

15.

PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

HIGH SCHOOL SUMMER PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITION - SUMMER 2022

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the part-time and stipend position as listed:

High School Summer Enrichment AP Psychology Teacher

Jenna Miah

$35.00/hr.

MIDDLE SCHOOL PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITIONS - SUMMER 2022

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the part-time and stipend positions as listed:

MS Summer School Program Band Teacher
Jasmine Gomez

MS Summer School Teachers
Angeline Flores, Juan Martinez

BILINGUAL INSTRUCTIONAL ASSISTANT STIPEND - 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR

$35.00/hr.

$35.00/hr.

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the bilingual instructional assistant stipend as listed:

Lorena Santiago Garcia, Kamila Dos Santos, Rocio Tenhunen,

Rosa Melo,Karina Castro Godinez, Barbra Santos Araujo,
Marcos Martinez, Yessika Moreno, Maribel Hernandez

ANNUAL STIPEND POSITIONS - 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR

$550.00/each

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the following annual district stipend positions listed

below:

DISTRICT

Curriculum Writers (50 hours per writer)
Dance Gr. 6-8: Meagan Ruland
Chorus Gr. 6-8: Lianne Kulik

Adult ESL Evening Class Teacher (Oct-May)
Claudia Giron, Cristina Medlin

Bilingual After School Tutorial Teachers
(MS) Sara Harris, Katherine D'Elia

Before/After School Bus Aides
Lorena Santiago Garcia, Christan Colon, Erica Wells

Building Security
Donna Perreira, Lorena Santiago Garcia

Community Based Tutor Prog. Advisor (New Hope)
Rosetta Jordan '

Community Based Tutor Prog. Teachers (New Hope)
Marjorie Chulsky, Brenda ltzol, Sheila Gibson, Renee Dialo

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022

$25.13/hr.

$25.00/hr.

$25.00/hr.

$13.00/hr.

$15.45/hr.

$30.80/hr.

$25.00/hr.
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195.

PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

ANNUAL STIPEND POSITIONS - 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR (continued)

DISTRICT (continued)

Lead Childcare Provider (Little Waves)
Marisa Rodriguez

NCLB Parent Involvement Advisor
Amy Rock

Home Instruction

Patti Grayson, James Reilly, Marjorie Chulsky, Ben Woolley,
Amanda Roa-Rosales, Brenda Itzol, Gareth Grayson,

Alissa Gallo, Nancy O'Toole

STEAM Program Site Coordinators
Elizabeth Muscillo, Doreen Regan, Lauren Sweet, Edna Newman

STEAM Program Substitute Site Coordinators
Maria Herrera, Brenda Itzol, Stephanie Pragosa, Mary Mazzacco,
Jasmine Gomez

EC/ELEMENTARY

Before/Afterschool Activities/Tutor
(GRE) Joseph DeFillipo, Erica Wells

Breakfast Monitors

(AAA) Melinda D’Amelio, Stephanie Pragosa

(GRE) Stephanie Dispoto, Michael Dombrowiecki

(JMF) Charletta Friday, Cinthya Lopez, Megan Levy, Sherry Reed
(LWC) Stephanie Kircher, Ta'Tyana Snelling

(GLC) Helena Taborda

Before/After School Extended Learning Program Teachers (Title 1)

(AAA) Stephanie Pragosa

Enrichment Extended Learning Program Advisors
(GLC) Kelii Shaughnessy, Michelle Morey

Head Teacher - Special Education
Amanda McDonald

Head Teacher - English/Language Arts
(GRE) Nicole Howell

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022

$3,950.00

$3,605.00

$29.70/hr.

$27.80/hr.
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

15.  ANNUAL STIPEND POSITIONS - 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR (continued)

EC/ELEMENTARY (continued)

Lunchroom Monitors $22.00/session
(AAA) Cynthia Branch, Melinda D'Amelio, Diane Wartmann,
Shatika Wallace
(GRE) Nijah Pizzaro
(GLC) Helena Taborda

Substitute Lunch Monitor $22.00/session
(AAA) Stephanie Pragosa

MIDDLE SCHOOL

Breakfast Monitors $13.50/session
Sonia Mendez, Eric Peters, Denise Rosa, Manuel Rosario, Diamond Vega

Lunch Monitors $22.00/session
Wanda Castle, Brian Howell, Sonia Mendez, Karina Mclntyre,
Vanessa Mantione, Manuel Rosario, Diamond Vega, Rocio Tenhunen

Head Teacher - Mathematics $4,069.00
Kristin Circelli

Zero Period $25.00/hr.
Jasmine Gomez, Louis DeAngelis

6th Period $4,635.00

Maureen Alexander, Katherine Gooch, Mary Ann Moriarty,

Camile Barone-Simon, Cynthia Crisanaz, Sharyn Benetsky,
Christina Bronowich, Rosalie Guzzi, Naomi Greca, Caitlin Mauro,
Joann Rohrman, Robin Reinhold, Brian Howell, Patrica Delehanty,
Denise Schulz-Nick, John O'Shea, Monica Avaria, Karan DeGraw

Jill Careri

A.M/ Concert/Jazz Band $4,120.00
Jasmine Gomez

HIGH SCHOOL

Detention - Saturday $25.00/hr.

Ron Bennett

Breakfast Monitors $13.50/session
(HS) Ron Bennett, Jared Walker
(HHS) Janette Egan, Lisa Johnson

Class Advisor Gr. 11 $2,987.00

Maria Concetta Davi-Donnelly

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022




H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

15.  ANNUAL STIPEND POSITIONS - 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR (continued)
MIDDLE SCHOOL (continued)

Crew Chief Nights $1,494.00
Kenvon Grant

Future Business Leaders of America Club Advisor $773.00
Sajdah Muhammad

Interact Club Advisor $1,300.00
Vito Terranova

Policy Debate Team Advisors $25.75/hr.
Meghan Cook

Lanquage Club Advisor - ltalian $773.00
Natalie Hernandez

Lunch Monitors $21.36/session
(HS) Ron Bennett, Jared Walker
(HHS) Lisa Johnson

National Honor Society Advisor $1,377.00
Amanda McEwan

Science Teacher Advisor $1,648.00
Stacie Broderick

Student Council Advisor $2,216.00
Steven Macri

Band Assistant Conductor - Winds $2,955.00
Alyssa Morgan

Band Assistant - Band Front Advisor (Fall) $2,831.00
Ruby Whitesell

6th Period $4,635.00/each

Marisya Etoll, Meghan Rathjen, Jennifer Santana, Cheryl Scourzo,
Andrew Carlstrom, Zaida Castano, Connor Keating,
Allyssa Lompado, Francis Maneiri, lan Moore, Kenneth Morrison,

Nemeil Navarro, Michael Padovani, Meagan Ruland, Danielle Schneider,
Rebecca Stone

16. ANNUAL STIPEND POSITION - 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the following annual district stipend position listed below:

MIDDLE SCHOOL

Breakfast Monitors $13.50/session
Eric Peters

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022
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17.

18.

19.

20.

PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

COACHING/ATHLETIC STIPEND POSITIONS - FALL 2022
| recommend the Board approve/ratify the following coaching/athletic stipend appointments:

Event Workers (all year) paid Per Athletic Schedule Fee
Ron Bennett, Adrian Castro, Bruce Clay, Tatiana Corbett?*,
Terry Johnson, Steven Macri, Frank Scarlatta

Wt. Room Supervisor $1,400.00
Shawn Brown (p.m.)

CATEGORY 1 STEP

MS Field Hockey Head Coach

Rosalie Guzzi 10 $4,500.00
CATEGORY 3 STEP

Freshman Volleyball Head Coach
Sajdah Muhammad 6 $1,800.00

CONNECT 4 LEARNING PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT

| recommend the Board approve the attendance of the staff members at the Connect 4 Learning
listed below:

August 5, 2022 $25.24/hr.
JMF: Lauren Toffel

LWC: Kaitlin Baiata, Jeanine Fasano, Megan Liberatore

MOR: Catherine Svenda, Elizabeth Lungberg

CONNECT 4 LEARNING PROFESSIONAL DEVELOPMENT
| recommend the Board approve the attendance of the staff members at the Connect 4
Learning listed below:

August 5, 2022 $25.24/hr.
JMF: Marianne Carr

CHANGE IN TRAINING LEVEL 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the change in training level for the following individual,
effective September 1, 2022:

SHARON BABITSKY, Middle School Teacher, moving from BA to BA +30 on the teacher’s
salary guide.

JESSICA DOUGHERTY, Middle School Teacher, moving from BA to BA+30 on the teacher's
salary guide.

CLAUDIA GIRON, Middle School Teacher, moving from BA to MA on the teacher’s salary guide.

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

21. ATTENDANCE AT CONFERENCES/MEETINGS

| recommend the Board approve the attendance of the staff members at the conferences listed
- APPENDIX H-3.

22. APPOINTMENT OF SUBSTITUTES FOR THE 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve the following substitutes for the 2022-2023 school year:

SUBSTITUTE CORRIDOR AIDES
Zemeir Allen*, Walter O’Neill III*

SUBSTITUTE INSTRUCTIONAL ASSISTANTS
Tatiana Corbett*, Ruby Whitesell

SUBSTITUTE NURSES
Patricia Decker*

SUBSTITUTE TEACHER

Angel Blue*, Lisa Boneforte*, Emma Falk*, Chelsea Delaney Foley*, Xavier Jenkins*, Matthew
Melo*, Alanah Ramos, Giana Serpico, Daniel Tracey*

23. STUDENT TEACHER/INTERN PLACEMENT
| recommend the individuals listed be authorized to conduct their student teaching in the Long
Branch Public Schools as indicated during the 2022 - 2023 school year. Long Branch Public

School employees must complete their student teaching and/or internship outside of their
contractual hours.

Georgian Court College September, 2022 — December, 2022
Olivia Teufel Joseph M.Ferraina ECLC Linda Bennett

Monmouth University September, 2022 — May, 2023
McKenzie Delahanty Amerigo A. Anastasia Dana Hochstaeder

TCNJ September, 2022- December, 2022
Angelica Hernandez Long Branch Middle School Christopher Volpe

Rowan University September, 22 — December, 2022
Yonit Mendoza Long Branch Middle School Michelle Baker

Kean ' September, 22 - December ,2022
Raul Rivera Long Branch High School Sydney Lasquinha

University of Phoenix September, 2022- December, 2022
Lindsay Curtis George L. Catrambone Marlana Vitale

24,  TEACHER/MENTOR PROGRAM 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve the following individuals to assume the position of Mentor provided
by the Board of Education at a rate of $550 annually for a 1 year term:

LOCATION: TEACHER: MENTOR:
Amerigo A. Anastasia Shamika Blue Benjamin Woolley
High School _ Emily Caponigro Allyssa Lompado
Lenna W. Conrow Lauren Flynn TBD

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

24, TEACHER/MENTOR PROGRAM 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR (continued)

LOCATION:

George L. Catrambone
George L. Catrambone
Middle School

High School

High School

Pupil Personnel Services
Gregory School

Pupil Personnel Services
Middle School

Middle School

George L. Catrambone
Lenna W. Conrow

High School

George L. Catrambone
Pupil Personnel Services
Gregory School

High School

TEACHER:

Marisa Frigoletto
Ana Goydic

Brian Hanlon
John Kuhlthau
Steven Macri
Emily Magrini
Nicole McCreesh
Alyssa Milazzo
Alyssa Morgan
Kathleen Reinke
Flavia Robey
Jasmin Samol
Ximena Sanchez-Rodriguez
Autumn Schatzow
Meghan Schneck
Danielle Scutellaro
Monica Spooner

MENTOR:

Katie Wachter
Rich Ricigliano
Sandra Rabhily
Lindsay Mading
Hema Solanki
Amanda Russo
Melissa Joyce
Kerry Santos
Kristen Catrambone
Rosalie Guzzi
Bonnie Monteforte
TBD

Alyson Stagich
Holly Terracciano
Emily Grosiak
Greg Penta

Jayce Maxwell

25. TEACHER/MENTOR PROGRAM 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR

| recommend the Board approve the following individuals to assume the position of Mentor at a rate
of $550 annually for a 1 year term:

LOCATION:

Joseph M. Ferraina
Lenna W. Conrow
High School

Amerigo A. Anastasia
George L. Catrambone
Middle School

High School

High School

Middle School
Amerigo A. Anastasia
Middle School

High School

Middle School

Gregory School

High School

George L. Catrambone

TEACHER:
Brittany Bachman
Amy Branagan
Daniel Buhler
Zachary Clements
Gianna DeSarno
Jacqueline Eichhorn
Leah Fonseca
Nicole Fox
Amanda Griffin
Terrance King
Jessica Matos
Devon Mazza
Giulia Mazzone
Mary McGee
Sara Mugavero
Sydney Swingle

MENTOR:
Kimberly Walker
Anthony DeSantis
Alissa Gallo

John Luckenbill
Elizabeth Kaeli
Candace Bidner
Michael Padovani
Andrea Kelly
Chelsea James
Cheryl Martin
Vincent Vallese
Amanda McEwan
Melissa Trace
Christina Marra
Amber Anderson
Elizabeth Reid

26. TEACHER/MENTOR PROGRAM 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR

| recommend the Board approve the following individuals to assume the position of Mentor provided
by the Board of Education at a rate of $1000 annually for a 1 year term:

LOCATION:

Amerigo A. Anastasia
Gregory School

High School

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
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H. PERSONNEL ACTION (continued)

26. TEACHER/MENTOR PROGRAM 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR (continued)

LOCATION: TEACHER: MENTOR:
Gregory School Karyn Kukushev Stephanie Dispoto
Gregory School Paola Machin * Maria Herrera
High School Tyler Malone Staciann Sarno
High School Brieanna Serafin Meghan Ruland
Middle School Milca Yorke Elsa Ates

27. FAMILY/MEDICAL LEAVE OF ABSENCE

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the family/medical leaves of absence as listed on
APPENDIX H-4.

l. STUDENT ACTION

1. APPROVAL OF MONTHLY HIB REPORT P.L. 2010. C. 122 (A-3466)
| recommend the Board approve the monthly report as required by statute - APPENDIX I-1.

2. APPROVAL OF STUDENT ATTENDANCE AT THE MONMOUTH COUNTY VOCATIONAL
SCHOOL DISTRICT FOR THE 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve/ratify the High School students to attend the Monmouth
County Vocational School District for the 2022 -2023 school year listed on APPENDIX 1-2.

3. RECOMMENDATION FOR ATYPICAL OUT OF DISTRICT STUDENTS FOR
PLACEMENT AND TRANSPORTATION FOR 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR

| recommend the Board approve the following atypical out of district students for placement
and transportation for 2022 - 2023 school year:

CPC BEHAVIORAL HIGH POINT
Morganville, N.J. Tuition: $96,124.50
Transportation:
Effective Dates: 9/6/22-6/16/23
ID#: 91200175, classified as Eligible for Special Education & related services

4, RECOMMENDATION FOR ATYPICAL OUT OF DISTRICT STUDENTS FOR
PLACEMENT AND TRANSPORTATION FOR EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR AND 2022 -
2023 SCHOOL YEAR
| recommend the Board approve the following atypical out of district students for placement
and transportation for Extended School Year and 2022 - 2023 school year:

ARCHWAY SCHOOL

Atco Campus Tuition: $65,552.48
Extraordinary Aid: $35,310.00
Transportation:

Effective Dates: 7/5/22-6/15/23
ID#: 80100312, classified as Eligible for Special Education & related services

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022
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L. STUDENT ACTION (continued)

5. RECOMNMENDATION FOR ATYPICAL GEN ED OUT OF DISTRICT STUDENT FOR
PLACEMENT AND TRANSPORTATION

| recommend the Board approve/ratify the following atypical out of district student for placement
and transportation for extended school year - 2022 - 2023:

COASTAL SCHOOL

Howell, N.J. Tuition: $74,546.01
Extraordinary Aid: $37,324.00
Transportation:
Effective Dates: 9/6/22-6/16/23

ID#: 111500003

6. CORRECTIONS / REVISIONS TO MINUTES
| recommend the Board approve the following corrections/revisions to minutes:

July 27, 2022

PLACEMENT OF TUITION-IN STUDENTS FOR THE 2022-2023 SCHOOL YEAR

Keansburg School District - ID#: 20248635. The student will not be attending.Eatontown School
District - 1D#: 111200080 This should read tuition-in from Monmouth Regional. Keansburg
School District - ID#:20307692, student will no longer be attending AWC.

STUDENT TEACHER/INTERN PLACEMENT

Kim Walker, Montclair University, Lenna W. Conrow School, Bonita Brown (District Leadership).
This should have read: Bonita Brown (Principal)

ANNUAL DISTRICT STIPENDS - 2022 - 2023 SCHOOL YEAR

lan Moore; Curriculum Writer (50 hours per writer) $25.13/hr. Public Speaking Gr. 9-12 and
Stage Technology Gr. 9-12. This should have read 25 hours per writer.

Jessica Delisa; Middle School Interscholastic Ath/Rec Activities Advisor at $2,936.00. This
should have read Jessica DeLisa and Jamie Hayes at $1,468.00/each.

APPROVAL TO CHARGE SALARIES TO FEDERAL GRANTS FOR FY2023

That the Board approver/ratify the following individuals and their respective allocation of federal
salaries to be charged to the federal ESEA grant for FY2023 as listed: Maria Cuevas; IDEA
Preschool; $53,372. This should have read Emily Magrini.

EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR STIPENDS - SUMMER 2022

Meghan Amendola, Gerard Flint, Kerry Keating,Sarah Martin, Lisa Valenti, Melissa D'Ambrisi;
Case Conference CST - LDTC at $75.00/case. This should have read CST Case Worker -
LDTC at $150.00/case.

Thomas Corsentino, Samantha Montosa, Michelle Santero, Angela Robertson, Shana Linton-
Sanderson,Kim Kiernan, Dalwasia Jones; ESY Bus Aides at $13.00/hr.

This should have read District Summer Bus Aides at $13.00/hr.

Dominick Azzarone, Dennis Berweiler, Edward McAndrews, Donnell Coleman*: ESY Bus
Drivers at $145.00/day. This should have read District Summer Bus Drivers at $145.00/day.

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022
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l. STUDENT ACTION (continued)

6. CORRECTIONS / REVISIONS TO MINUTES (continued)

July 27, 2022 (continued)

APPOINTMENT OF CERTIFIED STAFF

Emily Magrini; 1 Year Leave Replacement Speech/Language Specialist. Replaces Gina
Bisogna (Leave) (Acct. # 11-000-219-104-000-11-00) (UPC # 1631-11-TEMP-UPC). This
should have read replaces Maria Cuevas (Resignation)

(Acct. # 11-000-219-104-000-11-00) (UPC # 0839-11-OFPPS-TEACHR).

March 16, 2022

HIGH SCHOOL SUMMER PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITIONS - SUMMER 2022

Gareth Grayson; HS Summer School Program Facilitators at $40.00/hr. April 1 - June 15 (25
flexible hours). This should have read $40.00/hr. April 1 - June 15 (with 25 flexible hours for
planning). July 6 - August 12 (Summer Program).

MIDDLE SCHOOL SUMMER PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITIONS - SUMMER 2022
Kristin Circelli, Elizabeth Giron; MS Summer School Program Facilitators at $40.00/hr. April 1 -
June 15 (25 flexible hours). This should have read $40.00/hr. April 1 - June 15 (with 25 flexible
hours for planning). July 6 - August 12 (Summer Program).

February 23, 2022

ELEMENTARY K-5 STEAM SUMMER PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITIONS - SUMMER
2022

Lauren Sweet, Maria Herrera, Cheryl Martin, Edna Newman, Doreen Regan; STEAM Summer
Program Site Coordinators/Facilitators at $40.00/hr. This should have read $40.00/hr. April 1 -
June 15 (with 25 flexible hours for planning). July 6 - August 12 (Summer Program).

EARLY CHILDHOOD SUMMER LEARNING PART-TIME AND STIPEND POSITIONS -
SUMMER 2022

Laura Bland, Meghann Cavanagh, Felicia Clark, Francine Marucci; Early Childhood Summer
Learning Facilitators/Site Coordinators at $40.00/hr. This should have read $40.00/hr. April 1 -
June 15 (with 25 flexible hours for planning). July 6 - August 12 (Summer Program).

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
August 30, 2022
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Motion was made by Mr. Covin, seconded by Mrs. Peters and carried by roll call vote that the Board
approve the following item (7).
Ayes (8), Nays (0), Absent (1) Ms. Benosky

7. RESOLUTION FOR CLOSED EXECUTIVE SESSION —7:03 P.M.
That the Board approve the following Resolution -

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Open Public Meetings Act (Chapter 231, P.L. 1975) allows for the
exclusion from discussion at the public portion of a meeting of certain matters which might
endanger the public interest or risk the deprivation of individual rights, and

WHEREAS, the Long Branch Board of Education wishes to discuss the potential
purchase of facilities with the resulting action being made public when a proper conclusion
has been reached and there is no longer a need for confidentiality

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, the Long Branch Board of Education will
hold a closed Executive Session in the Conference Room, 540 Broadway, Long Branch, New
Jersey. It is anticipated that the closed session will not last longer than 30 minutes. Action
may be taken in the public portion of the meeting upon recessing of this Executive Session
back into the open public meeting.

Peter E. Genovese Ill, RSBO, QPA
School Business Administrator / Board Secretary
Ayes:
Nays:
Absent:
Date: August 31, 2022

The Board returned to open session at 7:42 P.M.

ROLL CALL

Mrs. Youngblood Brown - President Dr. Critelli Mrs. Peters

Mrs. Perez - Vice President - ZOOM Mr. Zambrano  Ms. Benosky - absent
Mr. Grant Mr. Covin Mr. Ferraina

Mr. Rodriguez returned to the meeting.

DISCUSSION

Mr. Zambrano stated that he was made aware of a 5" grade student who wanted to go out for sports
but had to wait several weeks to get a physical in order to participate.

Mr. Rodriguez stated that he would look into this and try to expedite the process.

Minutes — Agenda Meeting
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DISCUSSION (continued)

Mrs. Peters asked if we were concerned about the curriculum for the start of the school year.

Mr. Rodriguez - We are following the new guidelines from the State of New Jersey. Letters were sent
out to parents in multiple languages discussing the op-out option. | did receive phone calls from 2
parents that ended in a successful resolution.

Mr. Ferraina noted that although opt-out options are good for public relations, many times parents
don’t understand what they are reading when they receive these notices.

J. OPPORTUNITY TO ADDRESS THE BOARD ON NON-AGENDA ITEMS
No one addressed the Board.

K. ADJOURNMENT —7:57 P.M.
There being no further discussion, motion was made by Mr. Covin, seconded by Mr. Ferraina

and carried by roll call vote that the Board adjourn the meeting at 7:57 P.M.
Ayes (8), Nays (0), Absent (1) Ms. Benosky

Peter E. Genovese lll, RSBO, QPA
School Business Administrator/Board Secretary
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